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BY-LA"\VS, 

)IADE, Ordained and Constituteu, by the Corpora­

tion for Superintending, ~Ian~ging and Condlll't­

ing, the Clergy Reserves within the IJroyince oL 

Cpper Canada, on ~londay the twellty-rOm! i, 

clay of J u!y, in the year of our Lord CIll'ist, 1 S 2(,. 

Be it ordained by the Corporation for Su per­
intending, Managing and Conducting, the ~ltl::·:, 
Uesel'Ves within the pJ'ovince of Upper Canada, 
and it is hereby oJ'dained by the authority of t:;!f': 
same-

First. That the affairs of tlte said Corporation 
shall from time to time be conducted, governed 
and directed, by a Principal and twelve DirectoJ'~. 
according to the several By-Laws which shaH Ill' 
made, ordained andcoustitl1ted, for the welfal'e 
and ~ood government of' the said Corporation 
and the affairs thereof. 

-
Second. That the LORn BISHOP of QUEBT.C 

shall be perpetual Principal antI Director of th,~ 
said Corporation and of the-aft'airs thereof', with­
out election 01' nomination. 
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Third. That in the absence of the Lord Bishop, 
the Bishops Official, or the Rector of Niagara, or 
the Rector of York, shall preside at the Meetings 
of the said Corporation. 

Fourth. That the Rectors of the seyeral Pa­
rishes of Kingston, Niagara and York, Cornwall, 
Grimsby, Ancaster and Hamilton, (Newcastle 
District,) together with the Inspector and Sur­
veyor General, shall in like manner be perpetual 
Directors of the said Corporation and of the 
affairs thereof, without election or nomination. 

Fifth. That the remaining Directors shall he 
Members of the Corporation now holding, or 
who shall hereafter hold Benefices within the 
Province of Upper Canada; and shall be chosen 
and elected by the Members of the said Corpo­
ration at the times and in the manner hereinafter 
prescribed. 

Sixth. That the Right Reverend Father in 
God Jacob, Lord Bishop of Quebec, of the Dio­
cese of Quebec; the Rev. Official Stuart; the 
Rev. Doctor Addison Ilector of Niagara; the 
Rev. Doctor Strachan Rector of York; the Rev. 
Salter Mountain Rector of Cornwall; the Rev. 
William Sampson Rector of Grimsby; the Re,-. 
R. Leeming Rector of Ancaster, and the Rev. 



'William Macaulay Rector ot' Hamilton: the In­
spector General of the Pro,-ince; the SurveJor 
General of the Province, for the time being; the 

'Rev, Richard Pollard Rector of Sandwich; the 
Rev 1\'11', Leeds Rector of' Augusta, and the He\,. 

311', Weagant Rector of 'Villiamsburg, shall lit' 
respectively the P"incipal and Directors; and 
shall be, and are hereby anthoI'ised and empo"v­
ered, to take upon themseh'es the management, 
tlil'ection and government, of' the whole affairs or 
the said Corporation, from the date of these lly 
Laws until the first Tuesday in the month of 
:February, which will be in the year of our Lonl 
ChrIst 1823; and t11at any two or more of sneh 
Dil'ectors, ~ith the Principal, shall be and con­
!'titue a quorum for the management, dil'ection 
and government, of the affairs of the said Corpo­
ration in all matters and things, with powel' to 
meet and adjourn as they shall see fit; Provided 
ne,"ertheless, that in the absence of the Principal 
not less than five Directors shall be a quorum, 
one of whom must be the OfficiaJ l or the Rector 
of Niagara or York. 

Seventh. Th.at on the first Tuesday in the 
month of February, which will be in the yeal' 
of our Lord Christ 1823, a General ~Ieeting of 

A2 
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the Members of the said Corporation shall be 
held in some convenient place in the Town of 
York, at the hour of one in the afternoon; and 
that three Members of the said Corporation 
shall then and there be chosen and elected, by 
a majority of the Members. of the said Corpora­
tion then and there present, to be Dit'ectors of 
the affairs of the said Corporation for and'during 
three years, to be computed from the said first 
Tuesday in February in the same year 1823; on 
which day the three Directors so chosen and 
elected, with the Lord Bishop of Quebec; the 
Official; the Rector of Niagara; York,. Corn­
wall and Grimsby; the Rev. R. L~eming Rector 
of Ancaster, and the Rector of Hamilton, with 
the Inspector and Surveyor Generals of the Pro­
vince for the time being, shall enter upon the 
execution of their respective offices of Principal 
and Directors for the next ensuing three years: 
and such course of proceedings shall continue 
and be observed on every third year for e\'er ; 
and the Principal and Directors who at any time 
'shall enter, according to the provisions herein 
contained, upon the execution of their respective 
offices, shall during their continuance in such 
offices manage, direct and gOl"ern, the wbole 
affairs of the said Corporation according to the 
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several By-Laws which shall be made, ordained 
and constituted, for the welfare and good govern­
ment of tae said Corporation and the affairs 
thereof; and any two or more of such Directors 
for the time being, with the Principal, shall be 
and constitute a quorum fOl' the management, 
direction and government, of the affairs of the 
said Corporation in all matters and things, and 
shall hal'e power to meet and adjourn as they 
shall see fit; Provided nevertheless, tha~ in the 
absence of the Principal not less than five Di­
rectOl's shall be a quorum, one of whom must 
be the Official, or the Rector of Niagara or York. 

Eighth. That the Principal. and two OJ'more 
Dil'ectOl's for the time being, 01' in the absence 
of the said Principal, the Official, the Rector of 
Niagara or the Rector of York, shall hold four 
Meetings every year, at some convenient place 
in the Town of York, that is to say:-on the 
Tuesday next succeeding the first 1Vednesday 
of' the month of' February; the first Tuesday 
of the month of May; the first Tuesday of the 
month of August; and the first Tuesday of the 
month of November, yearly, \vith power to ad­
journ and to hold as many meetings besides 
these as shall be needful, either at the time of 
adjournment or at the times determined by the 
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calls of the Principal, or in his absence, of' the 
Official, 01' the Rector of Niagara, or the !lector 
of York; and such Principal, or in his absence, 
the Official, 01' the Rector of Niagara, 01' the 
RectoI' of York, and Directors, shall haye power, 
as often as they think propel', to call extraordi­
nary meetings of the Members of the said 
Corporation, by an adyertisement in the King­
ston and York Gazettes, and at the same time 
by a Circular Letter from the Secl'etary; which 
advertisements shall be published during three 
successive weeks before the day which shall be 
fixed for such meeting; and the Acts of such 
extI'aordinary meetings so called, shall he as 
yalid and effectual in eyery respect as those of 
the ordinary general meetings of the Members 
of the said Corporation, hereinal'ter provided 
for. 

;Nintll, That the IJrincipal, 01' in his absenec, 
the Official: or the Rectol' of Niagara, or the 
Rector of York, and Directors for the time 
being, shall nominate a Secretary and Receiver 
to the sl).id Corporation, and such other persons 
as they shall judge necesSQry to be employed in 
the services of the said Corporation, and shall 
appoint to them respectively such salaries, fees 
01' rewards, as they shall judge proper, and as 
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shall be approved by the Govel-nor, Lieutenant 
Governor, or person Administering the Govern­
ment. That they shall bave power at their 
Illeasure to discharge the said Secretary and 
Receiver, and others employed as aforesaid, and. 
to put othel"S in their places, as they sball see 
eause. That the Secretary sblllll'ccord the pro­
ceedings of the said Corporation, and of the said 
Principa1, or in his absence, of the Official, 01' 

the Rector of Niagara 01' the Rectol" of York, 
and Directors; and that the Receiver shall re­
ceive and pay all monies which he shan be 
warranted to receive 01' pay by the Principal, or 
in his absence, the' Officia1, the Rector of Ni­
agara or the Rector of York, and Directors, from 
time to time, and of all such receipts and pay­
ments he shall be obliged to keep, and to pro­
duce regular accounts as often as he shall be 
required; and the Receiver shall also be obliged 
to give security for his fidelity in the discharge 
of bis office to the satisfaction of the Principal 
and Directors. 

Tenth. That the Members of the said Cor­
poration shall meet annually at some convenient 
Illace in the Town of York, on Tuesday next 
succeeding the first Wednesday in February in 
each and every year, at one o'cloek in the after-
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noon. That the l\'lembers of the said Corpo('a­
tion who shall be so assembled, shall be, and 
shall constitute, an ordinary General Meeting of 
the said COl'pol'ation, and shall then Q,ud then> 
have full po,ver and authority to make and ,con· 
stitute such By-Laws, for the management,and 
government of' the. said Corporation and the 
affairs thereof, as to them shall seem meet, ac­
cording to the tl'ue intent and meaning of the 
Charter by which the said Corporation 'hath 
heen constituted, and the Laws of the Province 
of Upper Canada. 

Eleventh. That at such ordinary meetings, 
the Principal, or in his absence, the Official, the 
Rector of Niagara or the Rector of York, and 
Directors, shall cause to be laid before such 
ordinary general meetings, an account of tlae 
proceedings of them the said Principal or Ot'­
Dcia], or Rector of Niagara or Rector of Y ork~ 
and Directors, in tbe execution of their offices, 
together with a full and distinct statement of' the 
Property and Estate of the said Corporation, in 
IJand,Money, and other effects, if such tllere be. 

Signed, 

P. l\IAITLAND. 
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AT a Meeting of the Rev. the Clergy Cor­

lloration on the 8th February, 1831, the following 

Resolution was moved by the Right Reverend 

the Lord Bishop of Quebec, and adopted:-

Resolved-That it being expedient that the 

By-Laws be revised and amended, and some 

additional By-Laws be adopted, ~, Committee of 

tlu'ee persons be chosen for revising the present 

B~--Laws, and suggesting such alterations in 

them, and additions to be made to them. as to 

stleh Committee shall seem fit, to be by them 

submitted to a Genel'al Meeting of the Board, 

next Summer; and that the Archdeacon of York, 

the Rcy. A. N. Bethune, and the Rcy. J. Miller. 

lit' appointed a Committee for this purpose; 

:tnd that a copy of tIle present By-Laws be 

printed, and sent to each Clergyman of the 

Pl'ovince, requesting such suggestions as may 

-;ccm to them necessary for their impl'ovem~nt. 

GEORGE H. lUARKL~\ND. 
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